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PLANNING COMMISSION ACTION, NOVEMBER 5, 2015:  On a motion by 
Commissioner Wasowski, seconded by Commissioner Koenig, the Planning Commission 
approved the request subject to compliance with all applicable codes, ordinances, and staff 
recommendations. The motion carried on a vote of 6 to 1, with Vice Chairman Dunn voting 
against.  
 
Reason: The majority of the Planning Commission agreed with the staff analysis, including the 
review process and the lot character analysis, and the finding that the lot character of the proposed 
lots are substantially the same as the lots in the area of comparison.  Commissioners also 
acknowledged the many ways lot character can be evaluated and the qualitative nature of 
character assessment, and they acknowledged that the proposed lots are fully compliant with 
zoning requirements.  Vice Chairman Dunn noted the Council had concluded the scope of 
subdivisions considered was too broad and then took the unusual step of returning the case to us 
for reconsideration. However, in the staff report on this reconsideration, the staff applied 
standards in again recommending approval whereas under staff standards initially applied in this 
case, and other standards recommending by staff and adopted by the PC in a July subdivision 
case, the conclusion would be that this subdivision would not recommend by staff nor approved 
by PC.     
 
Speakers: Mary Catherine Gibbs, attorney for the applicant, expressed support for the request. 
She explained the legal issues of the subdivision request and provided diagrams, via PowerPoint, 
showing the way the proposed lots are similar in size, shape, and frontage with other lots in the 
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comparison area. 
 
Sean Roth expressed support for the request.  He stated that application meets the technical 
requirements of Zoning, and that the approval process should be predictable. 
 
Tim Lloyd, Crown View Drive, expressed opposition to the request. He opposed the process used 
in this project’s analysis.  He spoke favorably of the process that had been used for a subdivision 
on Braddock Road.   
 
Helen Lloyd, Crown View Drive, mentioned the transcript of the City Council Hearing and 
expressed opposition to the request.  She opposed the methodology used in this analysis. She 
stated that the analysis was different from other analyses for other subdivisions. 
 
Deanna Rhodeside, 414 Crown View Drive, expressed opposition to the request.  She stated that 
there should be a high bar for the analysis.  She said the analysis that had been used for Braddock 
Road was the one that should be used. 
 
Mark Leon, expressed opposition to the request.  He said the median and mean should be more 
heavily used in the analytical process. 
 
Rebecca Rust, 506 Crown View Drive, expressed opposition to the request.  She said the process 
was different from the process used at the Braddock Road subdivision. 
 
Kristen Ellis, purchaser of 814 Vassar Road, expressed support for the request.  She said she is 
buying a house across the street and feels that the proposed lots are bigger than many lots in the 
neighborhood and are in character.  She said she will be ‘looking at the lots every day.’ 
 
Zorana Ilic, Crown View Drive, mentioned a document prepared by David Rust that analyses the 
lots and shows that some proposed lot dimensions deviate by more than ten percent from the lot 
dimensions of the comparable lots.   
 
Mary Hales, applicant, expressed support for the request.  She explained that the Braddock Road 
subdivision method had been used in the previous analysis, but that method was appealed to 
Council and remanded.  She also mentioned an alternative plat she proposed that would have 
adjusted lot lines by a few inches to make the quantitative measures look better, but these 
adjustments would have required modifications to existing houses. 
 
Jason Von Wagner, Cambridge Road, expressed support for the request.  He stated that tedious 
City standards give the city its good quality of life.  He further explained that he saw the charts 
and numbers from the analysis and found that the lots are in character. 
 
Judy Miller, spoke in support of the request.  She explained her work on helping develop the 
City’s infill standards and explained how those standards have protected the City, and this 
application meets those standards.  She said a denial would ‘discriminate’ against the applicant. 
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PLANNING COMMISSION ACTION, OCTOBER 7, 2015:  Without objection, this request 
was deferred to the hearing of November 5, 2015. 
 
CITY COUNCIL ACTION, JUNE 13, 2015:  The Planning Commission’s approval was 
appealed to the City Council by neighboring property owners.  City Council heard the appeal on 
June 13, 2015, and by a 4-3 vote, this application was remanded back to the Planning 
Commission for reconsideration.  The Commission’s instructions from City Council are to re-
review the subdivision on the basis of the comparable lots, but that the lots fronting on Vassar 
Place should not be included in the analysis of similarly situated lots and that similarly-situated 
lots should be those on streets that share similar characteristics with the street where the subject 
properties are located. Council also instructed the Commission that the area of comparison should 
be a smaller area that includes properties in closer proximity to the subject properties than the 
prior review had done.  
 
PLANNING COMMISSION ACTION, MAY 5, 2015:  On a motion by Commissioner 
Wasowski, seconded by Commissioner Koenig, the Planning Commission approved the request 
subject to compliance with all applicable codes, ordinances, and staff recommendations. The 
motion carried on a vote of 5 to 0, with Vice Chairman Dunn abstaining. Commissioner Lyle was 
absent. 
 
Reason: The majority of the Planning Commission agreed with the staff analysis, including the lot 
character analysis and the recommendation of which properties were the most “similarly-situated 
lots.” It also acknowledged that, consistent with a Virginia Supreme Court decision, the 
Commission could not consider the aesthetics or character of any dwelling that may be 
constructed on the lot in the future. The minority of the Planning Commission did not agree with 
the recommended set of “similarly-situated lots” and also believed that the lot width for proposed 
Lot 626 did not fall within the range of widths found at comparison lots.    
 
Speakers: Helen Lloyd, Crown View Drive, expressed opposition to the request. She noted that 
her property is designated as a National Historic Landmark given that former President Gerald 
Ford once lived there. She expressed concern that future development of proposed Lot 626 would 
have a negative impact on the neighborhood character generally. She also stated that any new 
dwelling on proposed Lot 626 would negatively impact the value of, and view shed from, her 
property.  
 
David Rust, Crown View Drive, opposed the request. He noted historic elements of the 
neighborhood and believed that the future new dwelling on proposed Lot 626 would loom over 
the neighborhood. He stated that the staff report lacked an analysis of the effect the proposal 
would have on property values in the area. 
 
Zorana Ilic, Crown View Drive, expressed opposition to the request. She disagreed with the 
recommended “similarly-situated lots” to which the proposal was compared, and stated her 
concerns about stormwater management and potential damage to retaining walls in connection 
with a future new dwelling on proposed Lot 626. 
 
Elliot Rhodeside, Crown View Drive, believed that the subdivision proposal would bring 
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instability to a stable neighborhood. He stated that he disagreed with the staff report and answered 
questions from the Planning Commission. 
 
Jason Van Wagner, Cambridge Road, stated his support for the request, particularly given the 
analysis in the staff report. He also noted the existence of other City regulations that would limit 
the size of any future dwelling. 
 
Don Brady, Crown View Drive, expressed opposition to the request. He stated that a new house in 
this location would detract from the neighborhood generally, and specifically with regard to 
property values. He also noted aesthetic and stormwater-related concerns. 
 
Mary Hales, applicant, expressed support for the proposal and referenced her May 4th letter to the 
Commission. She believed that the subdivision request would add value to the neighborhood and 
also noted her vested interest in maintaining property values given that she lives immediately 
next-door to proposed Lot 626. She also answered questions from the Planning Commission. 
 
Mary Catherine Gibbs, attorney for the applicant, spoke in support of the request. She noted that 
the request under consideration was only for the subdivision and not future development of 
proposed Lot 626. She referenced several letters of support and stated her agreement with the lot 
character analysis in the staff report. She also answered several questions from the Planning 
Commission. 
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I. DISCUSSION   
 
The applicants, Stephen and Mary Hales, request approval to re-subdivide two lots into three lots 
at 809 and 811 Vassar Road. 
 

SITE DESCRIPTION 
 

The subject site currently comprises two lots of record. The lot at 809 Vassar Road has 99.97 
feet of frontage on Vassar Road, an average lot depth of 115.8 feet and a total lot area of 16,409 
square feet. It is improved with a two-story split-level style single-family dwelling. The lot at 
811 Vassar Road has 117.61 feet of frontage on Vassar Road, an average lot depth of 120.8 feet, 
and a total lot area of 17,316 square feet. It is developed with a two-story Colonial-style single-
family dwelling. 
 
The surrounding area is occupied primarily by other single-family dwellings. Bishop Ireton High 
School is also located a short distance to the south and Douglas MacArthur Elementary School is 
located a few blocks to the northwest. 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

811 Vassar Rd Dwelling 809 Vassar Rd Dwelling 

Area of Proposed Lot 626  
(Brand-New Lot between Dwellings) 
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SITE / AREA BACKGROUND  
 
The Clover subdivision began development in 1946 when Rozier Beech’s company, RJ Beech, 
Inc., purchased most of the land that now makes up the neighborhood.  This company developed 
Clover in phases over the period from 1947 until the mid-1960s, with the first part platted in 
March 1947.  There are a total of 14 sections, each with separate plat filings.  The last section 
was filed as a one lot plat in May 1973.  The majority of the lots were created between 1947 and 
1963.  While the neighborhood was being developed, each section of the subdivision was platted 
and assigned lot numbers leaving un-platted sections in between until the neighborhood was 
fully developed.   
 
809 Vassar Road was first created as a lot in 1959 as a part of Clover Subdivision Section 11, 
but it was a smaller lot with 10,350 square feet.  It then abutted an un-platted area to its 
northwest.  The dwelling on that lot was constructed during that period in 1960.  The land to the 
northwest was platted in 1961, and some of it was added to the lot at 809 Vassar bringing its size 
up to 16,409 square feet.  811 Vassar Road was created by this 1961 re-subdivision plat, which 
is entitled “Resubdivision Lot 25, Block 3 and Addition to Section 11 – Clover.” That lot 
consisted of the entire remaining land that had been un-platted. That lot’s dwelling was built in 
1962.  The two lots remain in the same configuration today.  While staff considers the 1961 plat 
to be the “original subdivision” for purposes of this review, it is also relying on information from 
the other plats affecting these lots in its analysis. 
 

REQUEST BACKGROUND  
 
The Planning Commission approved this request on May 5, 2015, but that approval resulted in an 
appeal from neighboring property owners.  City Council heard the appeal on June 13, 2015, and 
by a 4-3 vote, this application was remanded back to the Planning Commission for 
reconsideration.  The Commission’s instructions from City Council are to re-review the proposed 
subdivision considering comparable lots, on streets that share similar characteristics with the 
street where the subject properties are located and not including the lots fronting on Vassar Place 
that were included in the previous analysis. Council also instructed the Commission that the area 
of comparison should be a smaller area that includes properties in closer proximity to the subject 
properties than the prior review had. Subsequently, the applicant discussed the possibility of very 
small lot line adjustments in the proposed subdivision boundaries, but it was concluded that these 
adjustments would not affect the lot character analysis in a significant way, so the subdivision 
proposal remains the same as was previously reviewed by the Planning Commission and City 
Council.  
 

PROPOSAL  
 
The applicants propose to re-subdivide the two existing lots at 809 and 811 Vassar Road into 
three new lots as shown on Figure 1 on the following page. Proposed Lot 625, on which the 
dwelling at 809 Vassar would remain, would measure 9,891 square feet and have a lot frontage 
of 59.12 feet and a lot width of 73.9 feet. Proposed Lot 626, the proposed vacant lot between the 
existing dwellings, would measure 9,452 square feet. It would have a lot frontage of 55.47 feet 
and a lot width of 66.8 feet. Proposed Lot 627, on which the dwelling at 811 Vassar would 



           SUB2014-0014 
809 & 811 Vassar Road 

 8 

remain, would be the largest of the three lots at 14,382 square feet. It would have a lot frontage 
of 103.98 feet and a lot width of 112.24 feet. 
 
Figure 1: Proposed Preliminary Subdivision Plat 
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ZONING / MASTER PLAN DESIGNATION 
 
The property is located in the R-8 / Single-Family zone. As shown in Table 1 below, the 
proposal meets minimum lot size, frontage, and width requirements for the R-8 zone. The 
existing dwellings also would continue to meet minimum setback and FAR requirements for the 
R-8 zone. The property is located within the Taylor Run Small Area Plan Chapter of the 
Alexandria Master Plan, which designates the property for uses consistent with the R-8 zone. 
 
Table 1: Zoning Analysis 

 
SUBDIVISION STANDARDS 
  

Sections 11-1706 and 11-1709 of the Zoning Ordinance contain several technical subdivision 
requirements and Section 11-1710(D) stipulates a general requirement that all lots meet zone 
requirements. Section 11-1710(B) requires that every subdivided lot be “of substantially the 
same character as to suitability for residential use and structures, lot areas, orientation, street 
frontage, alignment to streets and restrictions as other land in the subdivision, particularly with 
respect to similarly situated lots within the adjoining portions of the original subdivision.” A 
provision requiring new lots to be consistent with the character of other nearby lots has existed in 
the Zoning Ordinance for many years and was strengthened in 2006 in the first of three “infill” 
text amendments.   
 
Lot width is not mentioned in the Zoning Ordinance as a specific requirement. Staff evaluates lot 
width to provide information regarding neighborhood character. 
 
Section 11-1710(B) further explains that the lots within a given subdivision proposal should be 
compared, for the purpose of determining neighborhood character, to those existing lots located 
 

within the original subdivision area, evidence of which may be shown by: (1) 
Subdivision plat documents, including amendments to the subdivision over time, 

 

Minimum 
Required 

Existing Lots Proposed Lots 

809 Vassar 811 Vassar Lot 625 Lot 626 Lot 627 

Lot Size 8,000 sq. ft. 16,409 sq. ft.  17,316 sq. ft. 9,891 sq. ft. 9,452 sq. ft. 14,382 sq. ft. 

Lot 
Frontage 40 feet 99.97 feet 117.61 feet 59.12 feet 55.47 feet 103.98 feet 

Lot Width 65 feet 121.5 feet 131.24 feet 73.9 feet 66.8 feet 112.24 feet 

Side Yards 1:2 ratio,   8’ 
min 

54.5 feet  34.5 feet     8 feet      

 

14.1 feet   

10 feet 31.1 feet 10 feet 31.1 feet 

FAR 0.35 0.20 0.27 0.33 0.33 
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as well as the development that has occurred within the subdivision; and (2) land 
in the same general location and zone as the original subdivision with the same 
features so as to be essentially similar to the original subdivision area. 

 
II. STAFF ANALYSIS 
 
Staff supports the requested subdivision. The proposal meets the technical subdivision 
requirements for the R-8 zone and the proposed lots are consistent with other similarly-situated 
lots in the area with regard to suitability for residential use, lot size, lot shape, and lot frontage.  
 
Approval of subdivision plats is a ministerial, rather than discretionary, function of local 
government, and as such, approval should be granted if the applicant has complied with the 
requirements of the City’s ordinance.  However, the assessment of the subdivision standards 
requires some judgment to determine compliance. 
 
The proposed lots meet all of the minimum standards for lot dimensions in the Zoning 
Ordinance, and they are thus suitable for residential use and structures.  As discussed, the 
Ordinance also requires the proposed lots to be of “substantially the same character” as the 
existing lots in the neighborhood, defined as the original subdivision or surrounding 
subdivisions.  This site is located at a relatively unusual curve in the street. There are two other 
lots at a major curve in the street in the rest of the study area.  Determination that the lots meet 
the neighborhood character requires judgment to assess the relationship of the proposed lots to 
the relatively small number of lots also facing curved streets and to the rest of the neighborhood. 
Staff has researched the original subdivision as well as the surrounding subdivisions as described 
herein to assess the character of the neighborhood in relation to these lots.  This neighborhood 
has many rectangular lots, but it also has many lots with a fairly wide range of lot sizes and 
shapes, especially in the immediate vicinity of the site.  Staff has quantified several of the area’s 
lot character defining features, and believes that an assessment of these qualities and quantities 
shows the proposed lots are of substantially the same character as the surrounding neighborhood 
as explained in detail below.  Staff submits this analysis to the Planning Commission for its 
consideration. 
  
Neighborhood Character – Area of Comparison and Analysis 
 
Staff extensively researched the history in the Clover subdivision development and closely 
considered the lots that constitute the area of comparison and especially the subset of lots that are 
most similarly-situated to the subject site. As mentioned earlier, the Clover subdivision has 14 
sections.  The site in question is in Section Eleven.  The 1961 “Plat of Resubdivision Lot 25, 
Block 3 and Addition to Clover Section 11, Clover” which created the subject lots in their 
present configuration, is considered to be the “original subdivision” for the purposes of this 
review (see Figures 2 and 2.1 on the following page). However, this subdivision only includes 
the subject two properties, leaving no other lots to which the current proposal can be compared 
for the purposes of evaluating neighborhood character. The lot at 809 Vassar Road had been 
actually created prior to this plat, but in a smaller configuration, by the filing of the 1959 Clover 
Section 11 subdivision plat (see Figures 2.2 and 2.3 on page 11).  This plat includes two 
additional properties to the south, which when combined with the 1961 plat produce a number of 
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lots for comparison (2 lots) that is also too small for a reasonable analysis of lot character. As a 
result, it is necessary for the area of comparison to be enlarged, pursuant to Section 11-
1710(B)(2), to include additional “land in the same general location and zone as the original 
subdivision with the same features so as to be essentially similar to the original subdivision area” 
which requires an assessment as to which additional sections of the Clover subdivision should be 
included.  Staff originally used all of Clover’s 14 sections for its earlier review, but the 
Commission’s decision based on that review was appealed.  Following City Council instructions, 
staff created a smaller area for analysis by only adding sections that are in closer proximity to 
Section 11.  The sections selected by staff for the area of comparison are Sections 1, 4, 6, 7, 8, 
10, and 11, which are all proximate to the site in question (all but one of the selected sections 
shares a boundary with Section 11) and share many common characteristics with the proposed 
lots including frontage on the neighborhood’s two curved streets, Vassar Road and Crown View 
Place (Figure 3). This area of comparison includes 78 lots ranging in size from 7,770 to 19,735 
square feet. 
 
Community members have questioned the number of lots included in the area of comparison, 
suggesting that that the number of lots is unusually high. The number of lots depends very much 
on the specific case. In recent cases, the number of lots in the area of comparison have varied 
from as few as 15 (Lloyd’s Lane) to as many as 90 (Commonwealth Avenue). The areas of 
comparison for the West Braddock Road and Beverley Drive subdivisions were 29 and 28 
respectively.  While the area of comparison is important, the basis for evaluation is the selection 
of “similarly situated lots” within the area of comparison. 
 
Figure 2: Original Subdivision 
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Figure 2.1: Original Subdivision (close up) 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Figure 2.2: Section Plat 11, Clover 
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Figure 2.3: Section Plat 11, Clover (Close up) 
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Figure 3: Area of Comparison (Clover Sections 1, 4, 6, 7, 8, 10, & 11) 

 
 
Selection of Similarly Situated Lots 
 
“Situated” means positioned or located.  
 
Staff evaluated three options for selecting “similarly situated lots.” They are: 

• Option1: All of the interior lots within the area of comparison (65 lots) 
• Option 2: Interior lots that have frontage only along the outside edge of Vassar and 

Crown View, the two similarly curved streets in the study area (25 lots) 
• Option 3: Lots on the outside curve of Vassar and Crown View (2 lots). This option was 

requested by neighbors opposing the subdivision. 
 
Staff is recommending Option 1 as the basis for analysis. 
 
 
 

Sec. 1 

Sec. 4 

Sec. 11 

Sec. 6 

Sec. 10 

Sec. 7 

Sec. 8 
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Option 1: All Interior Lots 
 
Interior lots are those that are not on corners. In previous subdivision cases, the principle of 
comparing corner lots to corner lots and interior lots to interior lots has been established. This 
evaluation considers all of the interior lots in the area of comparison to be “similarly situated” 
(see Figure 4).  There are a number of irregular lots in the area of comparison that have wide 
front widths and narrow rear widths, which is the opposite configuration to the proposed lots. 
Inclusion of this variety of lot configurations within the selection of “similarly situated lots” 
reflects the fact that the neighborhood’s character includes some degree of variety in lot 
configuration. 
 
Figure 4 shows the 65 similarly situated interior lots in the study area, outlined in black, and the 
existing lots on Crown View fronting at the sharp street curve outlined in blue (the proposed lots 
are outlined in green).  The 65 lots range in size from 8,000 to 19,735 square feet.  The majority 
of the lot sizes are within the range of 8,000 to 10,000 square feet.  



           SUB2014-0014 
809 & 811 Vassar Road 

 16 

 
Figure 4: Area of Comparison with Option 1 Similarly Situated Interior Lots (in black) with the 
Option 3 Crown View Lots (in blue) and the proposed lots (in green) 
 

 
 
Option 2: Interior lots with Outside Edge Frontage  
 
City Council instructions also stated that similarly-situated lots should be those on streets that 
share similar characteristics with the street where the subject properties are located, so staff also 
did a second analysis of interior lots that have frontage only along the outside edge of the two 
similarly curved streets in the study area:  Crown View Drive and Vassar Place.  In this analysis, 
there are 25 lots that have lot frontage along the outside edge of one of the curved streets as 
shown in Figure 4.1.   
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Figure 4.1: Area of Comparison with Option 2 Similarly Shaped Lots that front on the outside 
edge of the curve of Vassar Road and Crown View Drive (in black) with the Option 3 Crown 
View Lots (in blue) and the proposed lots (in green) 
 

 
 
Option 3: Lots on the outside curve of Vassar and Crown View  
 
Several community members requested that staff evaluate an option that includes only the two 
lots in the area of comparison that are most similar in configuration to the proposed lots. These 
are the lots at 415 and 501 Crown View Drive.  These lots are outlined in blue in figures 4 and 
4.1 above and are given particular attention in the evaluations under Options 1 and 2 above, but 
they are exclusively evaluated in Option 3.  These two lots were among eight lots defined as 
‘similarly situated’ in the original staff report presented to the Planning Commission on May 5, 
2015. In the original staff report presented in May, similarly situated lots were defined as ‘pie-
shaped.’ During the June 3, 2015 hearing, some Council members suggested that more than two 
lots should be evaluated in the comparison area, but noted that the comparison area should 
include the two lots being evaluated in Option 3.    
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When evaluating neighborhood character, staff looks at both the typical or predominant character 
of lots in the area of comparison, but will also look at similarly situated lots that have 
comparable features to those that are proposed, which may be unusual or atypical for the 
neighborhood as a whole. The community members who requested this analysis suggested that 
character-defining feature of this neighborhood is the larger properties on the curved sections of 
Vassar Road located at the top of one of the neighborhood’s hills.  These include two lots that 
measure 15,897 and 19,735, respectively.  It also includes the property to the immediate west of 
the proposed lots at the corner of Clover Way and Vassar Road (401 Cloverway Drive), which is 
actually two lots under the same ownership with a dwelling straddling the common lot line.  The 
interior lot of that pair measures 8,400 square feet, and the corner lot measures 9,239 square feet, 
and these lots could be individually developed if the existing dwelling were removed.  Currently, 
that combined property has 17,639 square feet.  These three properties are considerably larger 
than most of the lots in the Clover Neighborhood and in some cases are twice the size of many 
other neighborhood lots. 
 
Community members also noted the importance of topography and suggested that the locations 
of the neighborhood at the highest elevations have more prominence in the lot character 
evaluation. Figure 5 shows the topography of the neighborhood. There are two areas at the 
highest elevation (150-160 feet). One is centered on Cloverway between Vassar and Clovercrest 
and includes the proposed lots, some large lots fronting on Vassar Road, and several smaller lots 
fronting on Cloverway Drive.  The other is centered on Viewpoint Road, just to the south of the 
Clover neighborhood, and includes lots at the end of Vassar Place.  The lots at 415 and 501 
Crown View Drive are located down the hill at a lower grade than the proposed lots and have 
elevations ranging from 120 to around 135 feet. 
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Figure 5: Topography of the Clover Neighborhood.  The highest areas are to the south and 
southwest of the proposed subdivision lots and at the southern end of Vassar Place. 

 
 
Comparison of Lots 
 
The Zoning Ordinance includes a number of factors to consider when evaluating lot character:  
“Lots covered by a resubdivision shall be of substantially the same character as to suitability for 
residential use and structures, lot areas, orientation, street frontage, alignment to streets and 
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restrictions as other land within the subdivision, particularly with respect to similarly situated 
lots within the adjoining portions of the original subdivision.” Character defining features can be 
affected by area constraints such as, in this case, the sharp curve of the street, and those 
constraints should also be taken into consideration as part of a character analysis.  In addition to 
the qualitative features that are important in evaluating the character, staff also evaluated three 
quantitative aspects of the proposed lots and the lots in the study area, based on lot standard 
measures in the Zoning Ordinance:  area, width, and frontage.  Section 11-1710(B) of the Zoning 
Ordinance does not include lot width in its list of evaluation criteria, but staff considers it an 
important indicator of suitability for residential use, and this measure provides useful 
information in considering proposed lot shape and configuration.  A chart showing all of these 
lots is provided in the appendix. 
 
Lot Size 
 
Proposed Lots 626, 625, and 627 would have sizes of 9,452, 9,891, and 14,352 square feet, 
respectively.  Staff’s finding is that the proposed lots, in terms of size, are of substantially the 
same character as similarly situated lots. 
 
For Option 1, the mean lot size in the 65 similarly situated lots is 9,299 square feet, and the 
median is 9,155 square feet, meaning that all of the proposed lots are larger than the mean and 
median sizes for the interior lots of the study area and are well within the size range of typical 
lots in the study area (Figure 6). 
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Figure 6: Lot Size Distribution for the 65 similarly situated interior lots in Option 1 and the 3 
proposed lots (proposed lots in red) 
 

 
 
For Option 2, the mean lot size in the 25 lots that front along the outside edge of the curves of 
Crown View Drive and Vassar Road, excluding the two proposed lots, is 9,486 square feet, and 
the median is 9,378 square feet, meaning that all of the proposed lots are larger than the median 
size for the lots with similar street frontages to the ones that are proposed.  The two Crown View 
Lots are shown in gray.  These have 10,619 and 12,638 square feet, respectively, and they are 
among the largest lots in the study area, but they are also comparable in size to two of the 
proposed lots.  The smallest of the proposed lots is very similar in size to the more typical lots in 
this comparison area (Figure 6.1). 
 
Figure 6.1: Option 2: Lot Size Distribution of the 25 lots with similar street frontages and the 3 
proposed lots (proposed lots in red and the two Crown View Lots in gray) 
 

 
 
For Option 3, a comparison of the proposed three lots with the two Crown View Lots shows that 
the smallest of the proposed lots, with 9,452 square feet, would be 1,167 square feet, or 11 
percent, smaller than the smaller of the Crown View Lots.  (Figure 6.2) 
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Figure 6.2: Option 3: Lot Size Distribution of the Crown View Lots and the 3 proposed lots 
(proposed lots in red and the two Crown View Lots in blue) 
 

 
 
Lot Width 
 
Staff’s finding is that the proposed lots, in terms of width, are of substantially the same character 
as similarly situated lots. 
 
For Option 1, the lot widths for the 65 similarly situated interior lots range from 64.98 feet to 183 
feet, with a mean of approximately 81 feet and a mean of approximately 80 feet.  The majority of 
the lots are in the 65 to 85 foot range of width, as shown in the graph below (Figure 6).  The 
proposed lots would have widths of 66.8 feet, 73.9 feet, and 112.24 feet, respectively, and the 
smallest lot width would be within the range of lot widths for interior lots in the study area, 
which would correspond with the general character of the neighborhood. This width would also 
be similar to the width of fourteen other lots in the area of comparison.  It should be noted that 
lot widths are not measured at the midpoint of the lot’s depth but are instead measured at the 
front building line, which is further forward in the lot.  The consequence of this for pie-shaped 
lots on the outside curve of a street is that the “measured” lot width is much smaller than the 
average lot width. Nevertheless, staff finds that all three lots have measured widths that are 
acceptably within the range to be considered in character with the surrounding area and notes 
that their average width is greater than the measured width. As mentioned earlier, lot width is not 
specifically listed as a lot character measure in the Zoning Ordinance, so this measure is 
primarily to be used as information in evaluating the overall shape, size, and suitability of the 
proposed lots for residential use. 
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Figure 7: Option 1: Lot Width Distribution for the 65 similarly situated interior lots and the 3 
proposed lots (proposed lots in red) 
 

 
 
For Option 2, the mean measured lot width in the 25 lots that front along the outside edge of the 
curves of Crown View Drive and Vassar Road, excluding the two proposed lots, is 80.6 feet, and 
the median is 80.5 feet.  The widths for proposed lots are 66.8 feet, 73.9 feet, and 112.24 feet, 
respectively.  The largest of the proposed lots would actually be the widest lot in the area.   
 
 
Figure 7.1: Option 2: Lot Width Distribution of the 25 lots with similar street frontages and the 3 
proposed lots (proposed lots in red and the two lots at the sharpest area of the curve along 
Crown View Drive in gray) 
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For Option 3, the two Crown View Lots (Figure 6.1, shown in gray, and Figure 6.3) have 
measured widths of 79 feet and 91 feet, respectively, and the narrowest of the proposed lots is 
66.8 feet wide.  It would be 12.2 feet, or 15.4 percent, narrower than the smaller of the Crown 
View Lots and 24.2 feet, or 26.6 percent, narrower than the larger of the Crown View Lots.  The 
widest of the proposed lots would be 112 feet wide, which would be 21 feet, or 23 percent, wider 
than the larger of the Crown View Lots. 
 
Figure 7.2: Option 3: Lot Width Distribution of the Crown View Lots and the 3 proposed lots 
(proposed lots in red and the two Crown View Lots in blue) 

 
 
Lot Frontage 
 
Staff’s finding is that two of the proposed lots would have smaller lot frontages than similarly 
situated lots. The proposed lot with the smallest lot frontage, at 55.47 feet, is more than 10 
percent narrower than the narrowest existing lot the area of comparison, which is 63.58 feet. In 
staff’s view, this alone is not sufficient to make the determination that this proposed lot is out of 
character with the neighborhood. 
 
For Option 1, the lot frontages for the 65 similarly situated interior lots range from 63.58 feet to 
235.97 feet, with a median of 78.53 feet and mean of 81.78 feet.  The majority of the lots are in 
the 65 to 85 foot range of frontage, as shown in the graph below (Figure 7).  The proposed lots 
would have frontages of 55.47 feet, 59.12 feet, and 103.98 feet, respectively, and the smallest 
proposed lot frontage would be 8.11 feet narrower than the range of lot widths for interior lots in 
the area of comparison. While this is more than ten percent narrower than the interior lot width 
range, this is largely because these lots, like the Crown View Lots, are positioned at a relatively 
sharp bend in their street.  Section 11-1710 (I) of the Zoning Ordinance stipulates that, in 
general, side lot lines shall be at right angles to street lines.  This configuration automatically 
ensures that lot frontages at curved streets will generally be narrower than the overall lot width 
and narrower than the typical, similarly sized rectangular lot found in most of the City.   
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Figure 8: Option 1: Lot Frontage Distribution the 65 similarly situated interior lots and the 3 
proposed lots (proposed lots in red) 
 

 
 
 
For Option 2, the mean lot frontage in the 25 lots that front along the outside edge of the curves 
of Crown View Drive and Vassar Road, excluding the two proposed lots, is 78.89 feet, and the 
median is 80 feet.  The frontages of the proposed lots are 55.47 feet, 59.12 feet, and 103.98, 
respectively.  Because of the curve of the street frontages of these proposed lots, two of the 
proposed lots have a narrower frontage than the range of comparable lots.  The Crown View Lots 
are shown in gray (Figure 7.1). These have widths of 79 feet and 91 feet, respectively, and 
because they are among the largest lots in the study area, they have larger frontages relative to 
their street positioning.  They, however, are close in frontage area to the narrowest of the 
proposed lots.   
 
Figure 8.1: Lot Frontage Distribution of the 25 lots with similar street frontages and the 3 
proposed lots (proposed lots in red and the two lots at the sharpest area of the curve along 
Crown View Drive in gray) 
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Option 3: The narrowest of the proposed lots, at 55.47 feet of frontage, would have 8.11 fewer 
feet of frontage, or 13 percent less frontage, than the smaller of the Crown View Lots. The 
smaller of the Crown View lots has a frontage of 63.58 feet and 12,638 square feet of area, so it 
is much larger than the typical lot in the area of comparison.  Staff considers the deficiency of 
8.11 feet in lot frontage as compared with the similarly situated lot at 501 Crown View Drive to 
be one that would not be easily perceived by the general public.   
 
Figure 8.2: Option 3: Lot Width Distribution of the Crown View Lots and the 3 proposed lots 
(proposed lots in red and the two Crown View Lots in blue) 

 
 
Conclusion 
 
In conclusion, staff finds that the requested subdivision is consistent with general subdivision 
regulations, the technical requirements of the R-8 zone, and is substantially consistent with the 
character of other similarly-situated lots in the area of comparison. While difficult to quantify, 
staff created a numerical presentation of the proposed lots’ dimensions in relation to their 
neighbors.  It finds that the proposed lot configurations are appropriate for their site and similar 
to their surroundings. Staff also proposes that if a dwelling is to be constructed on the proposed 
vacant lot, staff will ensure that neighboring residents are kept informed during the required 
grading plan process and given an opportunity to provide input. Subject to the conditions 
contained in Section III of this report, staff recommends approval of the subdivision request. 
 
III. RECOMMENDED CONDITIONS 
 
Staff recommends approval subject to compliance with all applicable codes and ordinances and 
the following conditions: 
 
1. The final subdivision plat shall comply with the requirements of Section 11-1700 of the 

Zoning Ordinance. (P&Z) 
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2. Prior to any construction on proposed lot 626, a grading plan is to be submitted and 

approved subject to the City’s grading plan requirements. 
 

3. No permanent structure may be constructed over any existing private and/or public utility 
easements. It is the responsibility of the applicant to identify any and all existing 
easements. (T&ES) 
 

4. Show the curb cut for the existing driveway at 809 Vassar Rd on the final plat. (T&ES) 
 
 
STAFF: Alex Dambach, Division Chief, Department of Planning and Zoning 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
______________________________________________________________________________ 
Staff Note: This plat will expire 18 months from the date of approval (November 5, 2016) unless 
recorded sooner. 
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IV.  CITY DEPARTMENT COMMENTS 
 
Legend:     C - code requirement    R - recommendation    S - suggestion    F - finding 
 
Transportation & Environmental Services: 

 
F-1 The existing two subdivided lots will continue using the existing utility connections. 

(T&ES) 
 

F-2 The newly created lot shall have new utility connections and must pay sanitary sewer 
connection fee applicable at the time of final plan submission. (T&ES) 

 
R-1 No permanent structure may be constructed over any existing private and/or public utility 

easements. It is the responsibility of the applicant to identify any and all existing 
easements. (T&ES) 
 

R-2 Show the curb cut for the existing driveway at 809 Vassar Rd on the final plat. (T&ES) 
 
C-1 The final subdivision plat shall comply with the provisions of Section 11-1709 of the 

City’s Zoning Ordinance. (T&ES) 
 

C-2 Any future development/redevelopment on the subdivided lots shall provide adequate 
storm water outfall per the requirements of Article XI of Alexandria Zoning Ordinance. 
(T&ES)  
 

C-3 The development and redevelopment of the subdivided lots shall not adversely impact the 
storm water drainage or create a nuisance on the public and private properties. (Sec. 5-6-
224) (T&ES)  

 
C-4 Any future development/redevelopment on the subdivided lots shall comply with the 

requirements of City of Alexandria Zoning Ordinance Article XIII and the applicable 
laws of the Commonwealth of Virginia at the time of submission of the first final plan for 
storm water management regarding water quality and quantity control. (T&ES)   
 

C-5 All secondary utilities serving this site shall be placed underground. (Sec. 5-3-3) (T&ES) 
 
Archaeology: 
 
F-1 This undertaking will cause no ground disturbance.  No archaeological action is required. 
    
Code Enforcement: 
 
F-1 No comments received  
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Health Department: 
 
F-1 No comments 
 
Parks and Recreation: 
 
F-1 No comments 
 
Police Department: 
 
F-1 No comments 
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Appendix:  Measurement of lots in Study Area 
Number Street Section Lot Size Lot Frontage Lot Width 

306 Clover Way 1 8000 64.15 65 
308 Clover Way 1 8000 66 65.78 
305 Cambridge 1 8000 73.54 73.54 
307 Cambridge 1 8000 73.54 73.54 
311 Cambridge 1 8000 77.35 77.35 
303 Cambridge 1 8001 72.76 72.76 
310 Clover Way 1 8015 65.75 67 
402 Clover Way 1 8024 68 68 
404 Clover Way 1 8024 68 68 
406 Clover Way 1 8024 68 68 
408 Clover Way 1 8024 68 68 
810 Janney's 1 8024 68 68 
403 Cambridge 1 8053 71.9 71.9 
405 Cambridge 1 8064 72 72 
407 Cambridge 1 8064 72 72 
409 Cambridge 1 8064 72 72 
808 Janney's 1 8067 68 68 
316 Crown View 7 8074 101.72 94 
410 Clover Way 1 8080 75.71 75.71 
304 Clover Way 1 8142 66 65.81 
312 Clover Way 1 8207 65 67 
309 Cambridge 1 8299 71.49 71.49 
401 Clover Way 1 8400 70 70 
308 Vassar 10 8400 80 80 
302 Clover Way 1 8529 66 64.98 
809 Clover Crest 10 8746 80 80 
307 Crown View 8 8800 80 80 
313 Vassar 10 8800 80 80 
807 Vassar 11 8800 80 80 
309 Crown View 8 8841 81.03 80 
402 Crown View 7 8912 81.02 81.02 
311 Vassar 10 8995 77.64 79 
403 Crown View 4 9155 81 81 
407 Crown View 4 9155 81 81 
411 Crown View 4 9155 81 81 
813 Clover Crest 10 9166 70.01 70.01 
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315 Vassar 10 9238 75.36 77 
311 Crown View 8 9340 90 89 
404 Crown View 4 9350 85 85 
408 Crown View 4 9350 85 85 
309 Vassar 10 9416 79.75 79.75 
805 Vassar 11 9422 73.94 75 

809.5 Vassar 11 9452 55.47 66.8 
314 Crown View 7 9460 80.77 81 
312 Crown View 7 9492 78.52 85 
810 Clover Crest 10 9525 85 86 
511 Crown View 4 9545 83 83 
515 Crown View 4 9545 83 83 
401 Crown View 7 9547 83.02 82 
505 Crown View 4 9599 83.47 83.47 
506 Crown View 4 9600 80 80 
514 Crown View 4 9600 80 80 
812 Clover Crest 10 9633 82.96 83 
811 Clover Crest 10 9665 84.22 83 
310 Crown View 8 9838 78.53 80 
313 Crown View 7 9872 90.33 87 
315 Crown View 7 9879 76 78 
809 Vassar 11 9891 59.12 73.9 
317 Crown View 7 9925 76 78 
814 Clover Crest 10 10506 84.62 88 
500 Crown View 4 10536 123.19 102 
415 Crown View 4 10619 66.39 91 
308 Crown View 8 10809 105.42 96 
414 Crown View 4 11779 133.36 122 
501 Crown View 4 12638 63.58 79 
811 Vassar 11 14382 105.98 112.24 
814 Vassar 1 15897 132 122 
812 Vassar 6 19735 235.79 183 
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