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original project for which they were created, and
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collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
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original project for which they were created, and
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use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
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drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
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original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
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method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
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photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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7/
28

/2
5

BA
R 

CO
NC

EP
T 

SU
BM

IS
SI

ON
 #

1

BA
R 

CO
N

CE
PT

 S
UB

M
IS

SI
O

N
 #

1
NO

DA
TE

PLOT DATE:
FILE NAME:25.0331-A-SHEET ELEVATION.dwg

IS
SU

E/
RE

VI
SI

ON

33
3 

N
. F

ai
rf

ax
 S

t.

DRAWING SCALE:

Ci
ty

 o
f A

le
xa

nd
ria

, V
A

333 N. Fairfax LLC

4800 Hampden Lane
Suite 300

Bethesda, MD  20814
P 301-864-8600
F 301-634-8601
WWW.EYA.COM

T
H

E
 N

E
IG

H
B

O
R

H
O

O
D

S
 O

F

w
ith

in
 w

al
ki

ng
 d

is
ta

nc
e

lif
e

R

The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
Copyright ©2025 EYA, LLC

7/
28

/2
5

BA
R 

CO
NC

EP
T 

SU
BM

IS
SI

ON
 #

1

BA
R 

CO
N

CE
PT

 S
UB

M
IS

SI
O

N
 #

1
NO

DA
TE

PLOT DATE:
FILE NAME:25.0331-A-SHEET ELEVATION.dwg

IS
SU

E/
RE

VI
SI

ON

33
3 

N
. F

ai
rf

ax
 S

t.

DRAWING SCALE:

Ci
ty

 o
f A

le
xa

nd
ria

, V
A

333 N. Fairfax LLC

4800 Hampden Lane
Suite 300

Bethesda, MD  20814
P 301-864-8600
F 301-634-8601
WWW.EYA.COM

T
H

E
 N

E
IG

H
B

O
R

H
O

O
D

S
 O

F

w
ith

in
 w

al
ki

ng
 d

is
ta

nc
e

lif
e

R

The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
Copyright ©2025 EYA, LLC
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
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reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
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original project for which they were created, and
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drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
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method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
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constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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The use of these plans shall be restricted to the
original project for which they were created, and
publication thereof is expressly limited to such
use.  Reuse, reproduction or publication by any
method, in whole or in part, is prohibited.  This
drawing is classified as part of an unpublished
collection of visual art under the 1978 copyright
act.  It is an exclusive work of original authorship.
Non of the pictorial graphic or technical charts or
drawings depicted on this sheet may be
reproduced by any method, including tracing or
photocopying, stored in a retrieval system, or
transmitted in any form or by means electronic,
mechanical or otherwise, nor may they be used or
re-used for any purpose without the express prior
written permission of the author.  Title and
ownership remains with the author without
prejudice.  Visual contact with these plans shall
constitute prima facie evidence of the acceptance
of these restrictions.  ALL RIGHTS RESERVED.
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